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Dear Friends, 
 
We have just celebrated the birth of our Nation.  A great Nation, founded on Christian principles 
and Godly values of freedom for all.  Lately, my wife Susan and I have been heartbroken to hear 
the many stories of so many people who have overdosed on drugs. Their lives in turmoil and 
defeat. Their dependence on drugs leaving them anything but free.  They often get started on 
drugs in their teens and find themselves still entrapped in their 20’s, 30’s and 40’s.  They did not 
start out wanting to be addicted to drugs, but they believed the lies of the enemy. Just the other 
day, Susan was told of a mother in her thirties, who had a baby two weeks ago and overdosed on 
heroin.  She had just been given her older daughter back from foster care.  Thankfully her Mother 
and daughter found her and she is currently hospitalized.  Please keep her in your prayers. We all 
have family members or know someone who has battled with drugs.  

  
Like it or not, we are in the midst of spiritual warfare. It’s not against people who  oppose us, who 
slander us ,who attack us, who hurt our feelings, who seemingly block our way to victory, it is 
instead against what Paul tells us are “the rulers, the authorities, the powers of this dark world 
and the spiritual forces of evil in the heavenly realms.”  You see, the enemy is evil and he’s on the 
attack to destroy you and your family. Jesus said of Satan, “For there is no truth in him.”  When 
he lies, he speaks his native language, for he is a liar and the father of lies.” John 8:44.  “Your 
enemy, the devil, prowls around like a roaring lion looking for someone to devour.”  1Peter 5:8. 
  
But, we who believe in Jesus can make a difference in people’s lives.  We have the truth that sets 
people free.  When you’re around a young person, be sure to smile and tell them that Jesus loves 
them.  That Jesus wants to be their best friend.  Someone they can talk with and turn to 
everyday.  Talk to them about the great men and woman in the Bible and how they defeated the 
enemies that came against them and their nation. We need to be people of prayer and let us not 
forget that Jesus gave us the authority to trample on snakes and scorpions and over all the power 
of the enemy and nothing will harm us. Luke 10:19. 
 
I hope you will bring a young person or family member to the “Praise and Worship Night” at the 
Fire Escape Coffee House in Weymouth on July 25, 2015.  

   FIRE ESCAPE COFFEEHOUSE 

We invite everyone to come join us for a night of praising and worshipping our Lord Jesus, 
Saturday, July 25th starting at 8:00 pm at the Fire Escape Coffeehouse located at 159 Washington 
Street, Weymouth Landing.  I’ll be ministering in music with “The Band” Matt Nighorn on rhythm 
guitar, Rich O’Reilly on bass guitar, Mark Pennio on lead guitar and Chris Turcotte on drums. 
Some of the songs we’ll be sharing are Mighty To Save, The Greatest Thing, Welcome To My 
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World, One Pair of Hands, Overcome and much more! Hope to see you Saturday, July 25th! Why 
not invite a friend!  

I’ll be ministering in music with “The Band” Matt Nighorn, Rich O’Reilly, Tom Johnson, Chris 
Turcotte and Mark Pennio. Some of the songs we’ll be sharing are Mighty To Save, The Greatest 
Thing, Welcome To My World, One Pair of Hands Be Bold Be Strong and much more!  

Hope to see you July 19th! 

    HIS KIDS WEBSITE 

HIS Kids Ministries website, hiskids.org, continues to reach people all over the world for Jesus.  To 
date HIS Kids has ministered the good news to 118 countries.  We invite you to visit our website 
www.hiskids.org. 

RADIO OUTREACH 

HIS Kids Ministries Music Outreach Radio Program celebrating our twenty fourth year of 
broadcasting the hope of our Lord Jesus through His word and His music.  We invite you to listen 
to our broadcast Monday through Friday on WSMA (90.5FM) 5:00-5:30PM and Sunday mornings 
from 8:00-8:30 AM. Also Saturday afternoons 3:00 PM at www.echoevangelique.org 88.9 FM 
SCA, 92 KHZ. WE NEED YOUR HELP. 

THANK YOU 

To those of you who partner with His Kids Ministry, we sincerely thank you so very much for your 
faithfulness, continued financial support and your prayers. I know that this is a challenging time 
for many, but because of our Lord Jesus and faithful people like you, His Kids is able to continue 
to be a blessing. You can send your tax deductible gift to His Kids Ministry, PO Box 1061, W. 
Hanover, MA 02339.  May our Lord richly bless you, and keep pressing on. “I press on toward the 
goal to win the prize for which God has called me heavenward in Christ Jesus” Philippians 3:14 

 

Yours in Christ, 
 
John Pennio  
President and Founder  


